

Regular Meeting of the Vestal Town Board September 12, 2012

The Regular Meeting of the Town Board of the Town of Vestal, County of Broome and the State of New York was held at the Town Hall, 605 Vestal Parkway W, Vestal, NY on September 12, 2012

TOWN BOARD PRESENT:

Supervisor John Schaffer
Councilman Fran Majewski
Councilwoman Patty Fitzgerald
Councilman David Marnicki
Councilman Steve Milkovich

ALSO ATTENDING: Town Attorney David Berger, Town Clerk Emil Bielecki, 1st Deputy Town Clerk Kathie Young and approximately 60 members of the community.

The Supervisor called the Regular Meeting in the Vestal Town Board Room to order at **6:00 PM**, welcomed everyone and asked that all present join in the PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE:

APPROVAL OF MINUTES

On a motion of Councilman Majewski, seconded by Councilman Milkovich, the following resolution was

ADOPTED Ayes 5 Majewski, Fitzgerald, Milkovich, Marnicki, Schaffer
 Nays 0

Resolved the Minutes of the Regular Meeting on September 22, 2012 and a Special Meeting on September 27th, 2012 are approved.

BID OPENINGS

Bid Results for Communication Tower Projects

The bids for the **design and construction** of a new 150' **communication tower** at **Andrews Road** and the **relocation** of the existing 100' communication tower to the **Kopernik site** were opened September 4, 2012 at 2:00 pm in the Town Clerk's Office with the following results:

Sabre Communications
Newburgh, IN 47530

NO BID

ISQFT **NO BID**
Cincinnati OH 45242

Plexicomm Internet Solutions (single bid rec'd) \$75,240.00
Binghamton, NY 13902

ZMK **NO BID**
Apalachin, NY 13732

Regular Meeting of the Vestal Town Board September 12, 2012

Sigma Marketing NO BID
Oxford, MA 01540

Bid Results for Fire Fighter Protective Clothing Re-bid

Bids received for **Lion Apparel's Janeville V-Force Firefighter Protective Clothing** were opened on September 5, 2012 at 2pm in the Town Clerk's Office with the following results:

Har-Rob Fire Apparatus	\$2214.55
Endicott, NY 13760	
Fire-End & Croker Corporation	\$2,053.80
Elmsford, New York 10523	

Bid Results for Combination Sewer Cleaner

The bids received for a **Combination Sewer Cleaner** were opened on September 6, 2012 at 2:00 PM in the Town Clerk's Office with the following results.

Eagle Equipment	\$304,605.00
3388 Route 22 West	Trade In - \$68,000.00
Branchburg, NJ 08876	\$236,605.00
Joe Johnson Equipment Inc.	\$271,853.00
62 LaGrange Avenue	Trade In - \$40,000
Rochester, NY 14613	\$231,852.00
Environmental Solutions	NO BID
Elgin, IL 60120	
Vantage Equipment	NO BID
Syracuse, NY 13206	

The bids for the **Weis Market and 910 Tracy Creek Road Creek Bank Slope Repair** were opened on September 10, 2012 in the Town Clerk's Office with the following results:

**Regular Meeting of the Vestal Town Board
September 12, 2012**

ZMK
3430 Route 434
Apalachin, NY 13732 **\$164,450.00**

Boland's Excavating & Topsoil
1403 Milburn Drive
Conklin, NY 13748 **No BID**

Procon Contracting, LLC
PO Box 1037
Vestal, NY 13850 **\$126,929.00**

JB's Excavation Services
2213 Long Creek Road
Apalachin, New York 13732 **\$ 97,350.00**

Allis Development
137 Ridge Road
Vestal, NY 13850 **No BID**

iSqFt
4500 Lake Forest Drive
Cincinnati, OH 45242 **No BID**

PUBLIC HEARINGS

Public Hearings regarding the Petitions for the Establishment of:

Consolidated Sewer District # 1 Extension 154

Petitioner: Matco Electric
B.C.T.M.P.: 142.04-1-31
Address: 3913 Gates Road

Consolidated Water District #1 Extension No. 193

Petitioner: Matco Electric
B.C.T.M.P.: 142.04-1-31
Address: 3913 Gates Road

The Supervisor offered *Proof of Posting* and *Affidavit of Publication* and opened the Public Hearing.

Seeing or hearing no one wishing to speak the Supervisor closed the Public Hearing.

Establish CSD #1 Extension 154 and CWD #1 Extension No. 193

R249-12 On a motion of Councilman Marnicki, seconded by Councilwoman Fitzgerald, the following resolution was

ADOPTED Ayes 5 Majewski, Fitzgerald, Milkovich, Marnicki, Schaffer
Nays 0

Resolved to adopt the establishment of the following:

Regular Meeting of the Vestal Town Board September 12, 2012

Consolidated Sewer District # 1 Extension 154

Petitioner: Matco Electric
B.C.T.M.P.: 142.04-1-31
Address: 3913 Gates Road

Consolidated Water District #1 Extension No. 193

Petitioner: Matco Electric
B.C.T.M.P.: 142.04-1-31
Address: 3913 Gates Road

PRIVILEGE OF THE FLOOR – For Agenda Items Only:

Speaker asked if companies based in New York get any preference over out-of-state companies in bidding for projects. Supervisor Schaffer responded that they did not.

Speaker asked how the Town decides to close capital projects. Councilman Majewski responded that these are projects that were never completed and have unexpended funds which are moved to the general fund or to reduce indebtedness.

Speaker feels that we too much debt and that fund transfers are illegal. Supervisor Schaffer responded that we are at less than 10% of our debt limit and we have to incur debt to some degree as part of doing business.

Speaker asked about what the repair reserve fund for the Coal House and how much money will the Coal House generate. Supervisor Schaffer responded that the reserve fund will be funded from the rent and profits received from leasing the Coal House. It will take a public hearing and Board approval to use this money. The rent will be \$483.00 per month 30% of the profits.

Councilman Marnicki – There are also plans to stage various events at the Coal House and we will consider moving the Farmer's Market to the location.

Speaker expressed support for all this activity but felt that the Town was unfair in rejecting a plan to open up a high caliber flea market on Vestal Road.

In response to a question about the cell tower bids, Supervisor Schaffer stated that the Town is looking to generate additional revenue from hosting cell towers.

Regular Meeting of the Vestal Town Board
September 12, 2012

RESOLUTIONS & MOTIONS:

Councilman Marnicki stated that this budget transfer would fund two more people until the end of the year.

Hire Two Highway Laborers and Execute Budget Transfers

R250-12 On a motion of Councilman Marnicki, seconded by Councilman Milkovich, the following resolution was

ADOPTED Ayes 5 Majewski, Fitzgerald, Milkovich, Marnicki, Schaffer
Nays 0

Resolved that the **Highway Superintendent hire two laborers** replacing two retired heavy equipment operators and authorizing the **budget transfers**, per the Comptroller's memo dated September 7th, 2012, needed to allow for this hiring.

Declaration of SEQR

R251-12 On a motion of Councilman Marnicki, seconded by Councilman Majewski, the following resolution was

ADOPTED Ayes 5 Majewski, Fitzgerald, Milkovich, Marnicki, Schaffer
Nays 0

Resolved the following Resolution is adopted:

Pursuant to 6 NYCRR section 617.13 (f) and 617.5 of the **SEQR** regulations, it is hereby determined that the action proposed to approve the lease/licensing agreement between the Town of Vestal and **Communication Management Associates, Inc.** constitutes a Type II action as defined under said regulation and does not require an environmental impact statement or any other determination or procedure.

Communication Management Associates, Inc.

R252-12 On a motion of Councilman Majewski, seconded by Councilman Marnicki, the following resolution was

ADOPTED Ayes 5 Majewski, Fitzgerald, Milkovich, Marnicki, Schaffer
Nays 0

Resolved to adopt a resolution authorizing the Supervisor to sign a three-year agreement with **Communication Management Associates, Inc.** to promote the lease/license for wireless communications through Town of Vestal properties and rights of way.

Regular Meeting of the Vestal Town Board
September 12, 2012

Transfer of 2006 Dodge Durango – Police to Fire

R253-12 On a motion of Councilman Milkovich, seconded by Councilman Majewski, the following resolution was

ADOPTED Ayes 5 Majewski, Fitzgerald, Milkovich, Marnicki, Schaffer
Nays 0

Resolved to authorize the transfer of a **2006 Dodge Durango** – VIN #1D4HB48N36F177414 from the Town of Vestal Police Department to the Vestal Fire District. The Fire District will pay this in 2013 in the form of paying the Police Department's share of a joint purchase of an emergency generator at the Underwood Road tower site. The cost of the generator is estimated to be \$1,750 for each party. This value approximated a fair value of the vehicle.

Town Board Meeting Hours Changed for 2012

R254-12 On a motion of Councilman Marnicki , seconded by Councilman Milkovich, the following resolution was

ADOPTED Ayes 5 Majewski, Fitzgerald, Milkovich, Marnicki, Schaffer
Nays 0

Resolved to change the start of the **Town Board Work Sessions to 6:00 PM** and to continue holding **Town Board Regular Sessions at 6:00 PM** for the remainder of the 2012 year.

Repair Reserve Fund for Coal House established

R255-12 On a motion of Councilman Marnicki, seconded by Councilwoman Fitzgerald, the following resolution was

ADOPTED Ayes 5 Majewski, Fitzgerald, Milkovich, Marnicki, Schaffer
Nays 0

Resolved the following Resolution is adopted:

Resolved, that pursuant to section 6-d of the General Municipal Law, there is hereby established a **repair reserve fund** to be known as the ***Coal House Repair Reserve Fund*** (herein after called the Reserve Fund). The purpose of this Reserve Fund is to accumulate moneys to finance repairs, other than those recurring annually or at shorter intervals, to the historic Rounds Coal House located on the rail trail.

Such Reserve Fund shall be funded by revenue received under the terms of any lease agreement for the use of this building and its grounds and from budgetary appropriations, if applicable.

Regular Meeting of the Vestal Town Board September 12, 2012

The Town Supervisor is hereby directed to deposit, invest and secure the moneys of this Reserve Fund in the manner provided by section 10 and 11 of the General Municipal Law. Any interest earned on the money so deposited or invested shall accrue to and become part of the Reserve Fund. The Reserve Fund shall be accounted for in a manner which maintains the separate identity of the cash and investments of the Reserve Fund.

Except as otherwise provided by section 6-d of the General Municipal Law, expenditures from this Reserve Fund shall be made only for the purpose for which the Reserve Fund is established following a public hearing and subsequent approval of the Town Board.

No Parking Signs on Murray Hill Road

The Chief of Police has received this request from residents who are not receiving their mail due to their mailboxes being blocked by parked cars from the university.

R256-12 On a motion of Councilman Majewski, seconded by Councilman Marnicki, the following resolution was

ADOPTED Ayes 5 Majewski, Fitzgerald, Milkovich, Marnicki, Schaffer
Nays 0

Resolved to establish the following: **No Parking** between 109-208 Murray Hill Road between the hours of 8:00 AM and 5:00 PM Monday through Saturday.

CONSENT AGENDA

On a motion of Councilman Marnicki, seconded by Councilwoman Fitzgerald, the following resolution was

ADOPTED Ayes 5 Majewski, Fitzgerald, Milkovich, Marnicki, Schaffer
Nays 0

Resolved the **Consent Agenda** is approved as follows:

PUBLIC WORKS - Marnicki/Milkovich

Legal Notice for DEC NRCS Projects

R257-12 Retroactive approval to place a legal notice in the *Binghamton Press* the week of September 3rd, 2012 as mandated by the DEC regarding the Natural Resources Conservation Service (NRCS) projects for the reconstruction of the creek banks and placement of riprap protection at two sites within the Town. The cost is covered by NRCS funding.

Regular Meeting of the Vestal Town Board

September 12, 2012

Refund for Sewer/Water Bill

R258-13 Authorization for the Business Office to issue a **refund of \$5.74** to **Michael Showalter**, the amount of his credit balance on his sewer water bill at his former home at 1141 Main Street.

Town Attorney to Advertise David Avenue Water Crossing Project Bid

R259-12 Authorization for the **Town Attorney to advertise** on September 16, 2012 with bids to opened and received in the Town Clerk's Office on October 2, 2012 at 2:00pm for the **David Avenue Water Crossing project**.

Budget Transfers for Highway

R260-12 Authorization for the Comptroller to perform **budget transfers** needed to **cover overdrafts and potential overdrafts in Highway Department Budget** lines per her letter dated September 7th 2012.

FINANCE – Majewski/Marnicki

Receive and File:

- **Warrants:** 2012 – 35, 2012 – 35E and 2012-36
- **Town Clerk Monthly Report - August 2012 – Local Shares Remitted:**
\$6,806.00
- **Comptroller's Monthly Report – August 2012**

Close Capital Projects

R261-12 Approval to adopt a Resolution, Effective September 12, 2011 to **close the completed Capital Projects** as listed and to direct the **transfer** of these projects **unexpended fund balances to the respective debt service funds** in order to be used towards reducing the Town's outstanding debt service obligations.

Capital Projects to Close:			Fund to Receive	Total Reserves
Project Name - General Fund	Org/Object	Unexpended Funds	Unexpended \$	by Fund
2005 Field Improvements	H0305.27100	\$ 10,968.54	General Fund, Reserves	
2010 Relocate Traffic Cabinet	H0610.23300	\$ 6,544.47	General Fund, Reserves	
2010 Town Radio Replacement	H0710.21900	\$ 0.00	General Fund, Reserves	
2010 Computers	H0310.21600	\$ 600.77	General Fund, Reserves	
2010 Highway Boiler	H0510.25132	\$ 35.46	General Fund, Reserves	
2012 Police Cars	H0112.23100	\$ 0.00		
2006 Town Hall Improvement Study	H1206.21900	\$ 24,034.37	General Fund	
			Total to General Fund	\$24,034.37
			Total to Gen.Fund, Res.	\$18,149.24
2005 Ford Tract Parks Study	H2205.27100	\$ 41,257.55	General Reserve Fund	
2005 Castle Gardens Parks Study	H2305.27100	\$ 39,044.45	General Reserve Fund	

Regular Meeting of the Vestal Town Board

September 12, 2012

Total to General Res.Fund \$80,302.00

2011 Hwy. Large Equipment

H0211.25100

\$ 451.13 Highway, Reserves

\$451.13

Total to Highway Fund, Res.

\$451.13

Budget Transfers

R262-12 Authorization approving the **Budget Transfers** necessary to transfer unexpended funds into the **Interfund Expense line** where it will be paid out of to the **Debt Service Reserve fund** and closing budget entries as per the Deputy Comptroller's memo dated August 22, 2012.

Town Attorney Billable Hours

R263-12 Authorization for the Business Office to pay the invoice for the **Town Attorney's billable hours** for the month of August. Total hours are 13 hours & 15 minutes. Total amount is \$1,987.50.

EMPLOYEES – Fitzgerald/Marnicki

Taggart as Court Attendant

R264-12 Authorization to appoint **Barb Taggart as Court Attendant** at a pay rate of \$40.00 a night. Barb Taggart and Joe Gallagher will share the duties with John Pelletier as a backup.

Court Clerk Meade to Conference

R265-12 Authorization for **Court Clerk Gloria Meade** to attend the *Annual Conference of the New York State Association of Magistrate Court Clerks* on Sunday, September 30, 2012 to Wednesday, October 3, 2012 in Albany, New York. Costs to be fully paid by a scholarship awarded to her by the NYS Court Clerk's Association.

Budget Transfer for Extra Hours for Business Office

R266-12 Authorization to **transfer \$3600** from A5132.4111 (highway garage heat) to A1310.1030 to provide about 150 additional **employee hours for the Business Office**.

Regular Meeting of the Vestal Town Board September 12, 2012

Town Historian to Meeting

R267-12 Approval for **Margaret Hadsell, Town Historian**, to attend Annual Region 10 Meeting on September 29, 2012. The Historian will cover these expenses totaling \$57.62 as budget line item A7510-4030 was expended for the state-wide annual conference.

Vaccines for Town Employees and Retirees

R268-12 Authorization to have *United Health Services Occupational Medicine* provide flu and pneumonia vaccines on October 5 at the Town of Vestal Health Fair as follows:

- Authorization for the Town to pay for influenza and pneumococcal vaccines for all Town Employees and for retirees with Town health benefits.
- Authorization for the Town to pay for influenza and pneumococcal vaccines for all adult dependents (age 18 and over) who are insured by the Town Health Plan.
- Authorization to allow adult dependents (age 18 and over) who are not insured by the Town Health Plan to obtain influenza and pneumococcal vaccines at the Health Fair by paying full cost. Such individuals will be responsible for paying for the vaccine(s) at the time of receipt.

Health Tests for Town Employees and Retirees

R269-12 Authorization to have *United Health Services Occupational Medicine* provide biometrics on October 5 at the Town of Vestal Health Fair as follows:

- Authorization for the Town to pay for glucose testing at \$7/test
- Authorization for the Town to pay for cholesterol test at \$10/test
- Authorization for BP & BMI testing at no cost
- Authorization for the Town to pay \$80/hour for the 2 staff needed to conduct the testing

Museum Curator to attend Workshops

R270-12 Approval for the **Vestal Museum Curator Dai Anne Newman** to attend the following educational workshops as follows: September 13, Delhi, NY; and September 18-21, Sagamore, Raquette Lake, NY. Both workshops are sponsored by Museum Association of New York (M.A.N.Y.) and *Museumwise*.

Regular Meeting of the Vestal Town Board September 12, 2012

The total cost of these two programs, including travel, is \$870.00 and to be paid for through a combination of funds from the Vestal Historical Society, a *Go! Grant* from *Museumwise* and through self-pay.

Transfer Highway Employee

R271-12 Retroactive approval of the **transfer of a Highway employee** from *Mechanic* to *Medium Equipment Operator* effective September 10th, 2012 and to make **budget line adjustments** to fund this transfer as per memo from Comptroller McKane dated September 7th, 2012.

PUBLIC SAFETY – Fitzgerald/Milkovich

Birdsall Fire Station Chief – Station 3

R272-12 Approval to **accept Ronald Birdsall as the Station Chief for Station 3**, effective immediately, due to the April 9, 2012 resignation of Assistant Fire Chief Christopher Lupold as Fire Chief. This term will end December 2012 when the next election for Station Chief is held.

Fire Training

R273-12 Approval by the Board of Fire Commissioners authorizing the following:

- Up to five members to attend a Foam Training Class Clifton Park, NY on Sunday, September 16th. There is no course cost but the standard meal allowance and mileage reimbursement if training vehicle or chiefs vehicle not available
- Capt. Charles Paffie to attend Ethanol Fuel Training class at the NYS Fire Academy in Montour Falls, September 24th and 25th. Cost for this course is \$25.00 and materials fees. Standard meal allowance and mileage reimbursement if training vehicle or chiefs vehicle not available apply.
- FF Eric Benjamin to attend Fire Behavior and Arson Awareness starting September 12th at Chenango Bridge Fire Company. No fees for this course. Mileage reimbursement if training vehicle or chief's vehicle not available.
- Up to 12 members to attend a Helicopter Landing Zone class on Saturday September 8th at West Corners Fire Department at 9am. No fees for this course.
- 12 Fire Police members and 12 Department members to attend a FASNY Highway Safety Course at Norwich Fire Department on Tuesday October 2

Regular Meeting of the Vestal Town Board September 12, 2012

7pm. \$20 FASNY member \$30 non- FASNY member. Training van or chief's vehicle if available or mileage.

Band Aides to Use Library Parking Lot

R274-12 Authorization for the **Vestal Band Aides** to have use of the **library parking lot** for visiting band warm up for this year's *Vestal Marching Band Golden Circle of Bands* on Saturday October 6th.

RECEIVE AND FILE

- Environmental Notice Bulletin, Notice of Determination of Non-Significance, and resolutions recently taken by the Binghamton City School District Board of Education and dated August 28, 2012.

END OF CONSENT AGENDA

COMMITTEE CHAIR COMMENTS AND UPDATES

Supervisor Schaffer thanked Councilmen Marnicki and Milkovich for their hard work on the Coal House.

ADDITIONAL PUBLIC COMMENTS

Approximately 25 speakers addressed the Board. A synopsis of the comments is as follows:

- Letter was read opposing fracking signed by Binghamton University professors and support staff. The anti fracking feelings are strong and growing and others are watching -- submitted the letter to the Town Clerk to be received and filed.
- Fracking will jeopardize the University from attracting best students.
- Syracuse and NYC are exempt from drilling to protect the water, why not our area?
- Last board meeting someone stated that homes are for sale in Vestal because of the possibility of drilling. Local realtors have named high taxes and flooding as reasons for selling in the Town of Vestal.
- Fracking will be a detriment to the Town. Those making money will leave and problems created by hydrofracking will remain.
- We don't know enough about the chemicals being used in hydrofracking. Once there is a problem there is no going back.
- Drilling has major impact on our bridges and roads. It will impact our lives and value of our homes.

Regular Meeting of the Vestal Town Board September 12, 2012

- The drilling companies are repairing and improving the roads they are using.
- This industry should not have been exempted from the federal clean water and air regulations. Why is this industry not held accountable? 50 years of accumulated knowledge is being totally ignored. The MSD forms will tell us all we need to know. It is unfair that this has been left to the Town Boards who do not have the resources of the state of New York. They have the best labs except for California. A moratorium should be put in place to force the question.
- In Pennsylvania they are reusing the fluid in different wells. There is concern about carcinogens, heavy metals and radioactive materials.
- Many doctors and high paying jobs will leave the area if fracking is allowed.
- Drilling will boost our economy. The roads will be improved.
- Methane migration is due to fracking.
- Speaker thanked Supervisor Schaffer, Councilman Marnicki and Councilman Milkovich for visiting gas drilling areas in Pennsylvania.
- Speaker requested a copy of a map from the Vestal Gas Coalition showing where drilling would potentially take place in Vestal.
- Currently there are 2500 signatures of non partisan people who would like a moratorium on gas drilling.
- Not knowing if or when the Board will make a decision has added to the frustration, tension and anxiety. We need a higher order of communication such as special meeting to hear presentations from unbiased professionals.
- Perhaps a group of professionals can make up a sub committee to bring the Board up to speed.
- There are financial interests involved in drilling not only for landowners but for the Town itself. This can benefit us because of the ad valerom tax. The Town and the School would benefit from the additional revenue.
- Last week there was a micro burst in Vestal. The amount of debris was incredible. The Vestal Highway Department did an excellent job in picking up the debris and they deserve recognitions for the good job they did.
- Speaker complained that effort by the Board to keep him from speaking at meetings violates his civil rights. Supervisor Schaffer responded that he has offered numerous times to meet with this individual but that he prefers playing to the audience rather than getting real answers. There has to be some reasonable audience control at meetings to keep things from getting out of hand.

Regular Meeting of the Vestal Town Board September 12, 2012

- The 6 pm meetings are good. The people who want to speak about gas drilling should be recognized first but time should be allocated for other issues.
- Non-residents should have an equal right to speak at the meetings. The Board favors business owners.
- Councilman Marnicki – from his research, there is no definitive evidence that gas drilling hurts property values. Some banks won't lend money for gas leased property and some will. He is not aware of any specific health problems caused by gas drilling. He makes his decisions on facts. It is not fair to single out just one industry. He's opposed to implementing a moratorium – it is a meaningless gesture.

Speaker states she is a landowner and has an increasing problem with people trespassing on their land: walking their dogs, hunting, building tree stands and driving their ATV's. They are also stealing their lawn ornaments. She will continue to call the police.

Speaker asked Councilman Marnicki if, as a land surveyor, he would benefit if gas drilling comes to Vestal. Councilman Marnicki responded that he does not do that kind of work and has no connection to the gas industry.

Responding to a complaint that non-residents are not allowed to speak, Supervisor Schaffer responded that he will always favor Vestal residents because that is who he was elected to represent.

Town of Owego Supervisor Don Castellucci noted that he faces similar issues at his meetings and that he too gives a speaking preference to Town residents. As in Vestal, they are also preoccupied with extensive discussion about gas drilling.

Town Attorney David Berger stated that the Town Board does not have to allow the public to speak at the meetings.

Responding to a complaint about cars parking on the shoulder of the Parkway during the Farmer's Market, Councilman Majewski stated that he would like to move the market to the back of the Library parking lot to leave more room in the front for parking. Councilman Milkovich would like to move the Farmer's Market to the Rail Trail.

Regular Meeting of the Vestal Town Board

September 12, 2012

OTHER NEW BUSINESS

Budget Transfers for Parks Seasonal Employees

R275-12 On a motion of Councilwoman Fitzgerald, seconded by Councilman Marnicki, the following resolution was

ADOPTED Ayes 5 Majewski, Fitzgerald, Milkovich, Marnicki, Schaffer
Nays 0

Resolved to transfer \$3,500 from line A9030.8403 to line A7140.1034 to cover wages for seasonal parks employees to continue mowing and other Parks Department duties for additional weeks.

SUPERVISOR'S ANNOUNCEMENTS

- DEC still has in effect a no burning ban through October if you have questions call the Fire Department at 748-1514 Ext 383.
- Main Street Bridge near Glenwood Road will be closed to vehicle and pedestrian traffic starting the week of 8/20/12. It will be closed for approximately 2 to 3 weeks. The bridge is being cleaned and re-painted. The detour route will be Pierce Hill Road and SR 26.
- Notice of BC Legislative Session – September 20, 2012
- Starting October 1 through the end of 2012:
 - ◆ **Town Board Work Sessions will begin at 6:00 PM**
 - ◆ **Town Board Regular Sessions will begin at 6:00 PM**
- The following is a list of dates and times that the Town Board will hold budget meetings.

<u>DATE</u>	<u>TIME</u>	<u>DEPARTMENT</u>
Mon. 9/17/12	5:30 p.m.	Fire
Mon. 9/17/12	6:30 p.m.	Highway
Mon. 9/17/12	7:15 p.m.	Library
Weds. 9/19/12	5:30 p.m.	Police
Weds. 9/19/12	6:00 p.m.	Parks
Weds. 9/19/12	7:00 p.m.	Recreation
Mon. 9/24/12	5:30 p.m.	IT
Mon. 9/24/12	6:15 p.m.	Water/Sewer
Mon. 9/24/12	7:30 p.m.	Town Clerk
Tues. 9/25/12	5:30 p.m.	Code
Tues. 9/25/12	6:00 p.m.	Assessor
Tues. 9/25/12	6:30 p.m.	Comptroller/EE Benefits
Tues. 9/25/12	7:00 p.m.	Justices

**Regular Meeting of the Vestal Town Board
September 12, 2012**

ADJOURNMENT

On a motion of Councilman Marnicki, seconded by Councilwoman Fitzgerald, the meeting was adjourned at 8:06 PM. Carried unanimously.

Approved by _____
Emil J. Bielecki, Town Clerk